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Note from the Lead Author, Samantha Ramay 
This International Security Report aims to provide a comprehensive analysis of Iran’s 
involvement in the conflict in Yemen, as well as the impact on international stakeholders. 
Through rigorous research and analysis, we endeavor to shed light on key trends, challenges, and 
opportunities in the realm of conflict and security as well as broader policy implications. 

We hope that this report will serve as a valuable resource for policymakers, scholars, 
practitioners, and all those interested in understanding and addressing the complexities of 
contemporary conflicts. 

We express our deepest gratitude to our donor, the Don Maland Scholarship Fund, for their 
invaluable and generous support for this research and publication. 
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Executive Summary 
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Risk Assessment Indicators 
Extremely High Risk High Risk Medium Risk Low Risk 

 

History of Armed Conflict   Level: Extremely High Risk Trend: Declining 

Destabilizing Factors: 

Widespread Displacement: Around 14% of Yemen's population, more than 4.5 million people, 
are internally displaced as a result of conflict, the majority of this population having been 
displaced multiple times. Yemen is among the six largest internal displacements in the world.29  

Humanitarian Crisis: The Houthi emergence in Yemen resulted in a decline in infrastructure 
and a lack of public health services. A weakened economy has 





 

Population Heterogeneity  Level: Medium Risk   Trend: Stable 

Ethnic Diversity: The population of Yemen is predominantly Arab and also contains Afro-Arab, 
South Asian, and European minorities.  

Destabilizing Factors: 

Religious Diversity: Virtually all Yemeni citizens are Muslim (99.1%) but are divided among 
Sunni and Shia (65% Sunni and 35% Shia).47 

Assessment: 

While ethnic and religious divides are not at the heart of conflict within Yemen, the religious 
divide between the Sunni and Shia sects represents the greater regional ideological struggle as 



 

Economic Performance  Level: Extremely High Risk  Trend: Declining 

Destabilizing Factors: 

Attacks on International Trade: The Houthis have attacked ships in the Red Sea, one of the 
world's lifeline maritime trade routes.58 The Houthis influence the Bab el Mandeb Strait, the 
strait linking the Red Sea to the Gulf of Aden and one of the most active shipping lanes.59 Before 
the attacks, about 15% of global maritime trade would go through the Red Sea. As of January 
19th, almost 25% of global shipping was diverted from the Red Sea and around Africa.  

Longer Travel and Higher Cost: The attacks have resulted in higher shipping costs and 
therefore higher prices put on the consumer. To go through the Suez Canal, ships now need to 
pay for double the crew, armed guards, and between $1 million and $3 million in war insurance 
in addition to the $500,000 for passage. If ships divert around the Cape of Good Hope with a 20-
30% longer travel time, there is the additional cost of an increase in fuel consumption.60 This 
disruption could inflate global prices by 2%.61 Vulnerable industries include aerospace, 
manufacturing (especially car manufacturing), and fashion.62  

Ongoing Yemeni Economic Crisis: In 2021 there was a sharp depletion of Yemen's currency 
leading to many lacking basic necessities. The unemployment rate in Yemen is about 13.57%, 
with 48.6% of the population below the poverty line.63 

Assessment: 

The Houthi attacks on ships in the Red Sea illustrate the vulnerability of widespread reliance on 
a single trade route. The Houthis’ proximity near the Bab al-Mandab Strait and control of 
Hodeidah, a major port along the strait, is a threat to current and future trade and could likely 
contribute to a global financial crisis. Additionally, the Bab al-Mandab Strait is a major 
passageway for Saudi oil tankers, meaning Houthi attacks threaten the kingdom's ability to ship 
oil.64 

Human Development  Level: Extremely High Risk  Trend: Declining 

Destabilizing Factors: 

Widespread Food Insecurity: Currently, about five million people in Yemen are at risk of 
famine.65 Increased prices on imported food coupled with poverty have resulted in many 
experiencing hunger. Climate change has also led to flooding, further depleting options for food 
by destroying farmland.66 

High Risk of Infectious Diseases: With 14.5 million in Yemen lacking access to safe drinking 
water and sanitation facilities, the risk of an infectious disease outbreak is a constant threat.67 A 
cholera outbreak between 2016 and 2022 resulted in a million cases and thousands of deaths.68 



 





 

Worst Case Scenario 

There is a considerable risk of the conflict escalating and spreading. Iran and Israel may escalate 
attacks, resulting in war between the two countries. This would snowball and bring in proxies 
and allied powers. If Israel goes to war, the US is likely to join in some capacity. Iran's regional 
proxy capability would aim for US troops stationed in the Middle East, potentially prompting the 
US to declare war on Iran. War would further disrupt global trade (potentially eliminating 
essential trade routes and sending the world into a financial crisis). With the escalation, 
humanitarian aid would be slim if not eliminated, and the vulnerable populations in Yemen and 
Gaza would continue to suffer. Specifically in Gaza, if Israel were to go to war, there would be 
an increased risk of a devastating violence inflicted on Palestinian citizens. In Yemen, such a 
conflict could result in a massive famine or outbreak of disease. In the event of either party 
(Israel or Iran) feeling existentially threatened, known or unknown nuclear capabilities may be 
explored. 

Most Likely Scenario 

The conflict is likely to continue on its current trajectory for the foreseeable future. The Israel-
Palestine conflict will continue to motivate the Houthis to attack ships in the Red Sea, and the 
members of Operation Prosperity Guardian will continue to aim for Houthi soft spots. The OPG 
members are likely to gain the upper hand over the Houthis, and while complete Houthi 
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